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After the 9/11 terrorist attacks, the United States and the United Kingdom detained suspected terrorists in a
manner incompatible with the due process, fair trial, and equality requirements of the Rule of Law. The
legality of the detentions was challenged and found wanting by the highest courts in the US and UK. The US
courts approached these questions as matters within the law of war, whereas the UK courts examined them
within a human rights criminal law context.

In Terror Detentions and the Rule of Law: US and UK Perspectives, Dr. Robert H. Wagstaff documents
President George W. Bush's and Prime Minister Tony Blair's responses to 9/11, alleging that they failed to
protect the human rights of individuals suspected of terrorist activity. The analytical focus is on the four US
Supreme Court decisions involving detentions in Guantanamo Bay and four House of Lords decisions
involving detentions that began in the Belmarsh Prison. These decisions are analyzed within the contexts of
history, criminal law, constitutional law, human rights and international law, and various jurisprudential
perspectives. In this book Dr. Wagstaff argues that time-tested criminal law is the normatively correct and
most effective means for dealing with suspected terrorists. He also suggests that preventive, indefinite
detention of terrorist suspects upon suspicion of wrongdoing contravenes the domestic and international Rule
of Law, treaties and customary international law. As such, new legal paradigms for addressing terrorism are
shown to be normatively invalid, illegal, unconstitutional, counter-productive, and in conflict with the Rule
of Law.
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From reader reviews:

Curt Roepke:

This book untitled Terror Detentions and the Rule of Law: US and UK Perspectives (Terrorism and Global
Justice Series) to be one of several books which best seller in this year, this is because when you read this
book you can get a lot of benefit onto it. You will easily to buy this specific book in the book shop or you
can order it by way of online. The publisher in this book sells the e-book too. It makes you more easily to
read this book, as you can read this book in your Mobile phone. So there is no reason for your requirements
to past this book from your list.

Harold Riggs:

The reason why? Because this Terror Detentions and the Rule of Law: US and UK Perspectives (Terrorism
and Global Justice Series) is an unordinary book that the inside of the publication waiting for you to snap
that but latter it will shock you with the secret this inside. Reading this book close to it was fantastic author
who all write the book in such incredible way makes the content inside easier to understand, entertaining
way but still convey the meaning totally. So , it is good for you because of not hesitating having this any
longer or you going to regret it. This unique book will give you a lot of advantages than the other book get
such as help improving your ability and your critical thinking technique. So , still want to hold up having that
book? If I were you I will go to the publication store hurriedly.

Bernice Martinez:

Playing with family in a park, coming to see the sea world or hanging out with friends is thing that usually
you might have done when you have spare time, then why you don't try factor that really opposite from that.
Just one activity that make you not experiencing tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you
have been ride on and with addition associated with. Even you love Terror Detentions and the Rule of Law:
US and UK Perspectives (Terrorism and Global Justice Series), you may enjoy both. It is good combination
right, you still wish to miss it? What kind of hangout type is it? Oh occur its mind hangout fellas. What? Still
don't understand it, oh come on its called reading friends.

Ann McLemore:

Many people spending their moment by playing outside together with friends, fun activity using family or
just watching TV the entire day. You can have new activity to pay your whole day by examining a book.
Ugh, think reading a book can definitely hard because you have to use the book everywhere? It ok you can
have the e-book, getting everywhere you want in your Cell phone. Like Terror Detentions and the Rule of
Law: US and UK Perspectives (Terrorism and Global Justice Series) which is obtaining the e-book version.
So , why not try out this book? Let's observe.
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