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As an Iranian Muslim woman and a granddaughter of a well-known ayatollah, Shahla Haeri was accepted
into the communities where she conducted her fieldwork on mut'a, temporary marriage. Mut'a is legally
sanctioned among the Twelver Shi'ites who live predominantly in Iran. Drawing on rich interviews that
would have been denied a Western anthropologist, the author describes the concept of a temporary-marriage
contract, in which a man and an unmarried woman (virgin, widow, or divorcee) decide how long they want
to stay married to each other (from one hour to ninety-nine years) and how much money is to be given to the
temporary wife. Since the Iranian revolution of 1979, the regime has conduction an intensive campaign to
revitalize this form of marriage, and Shi'i ulama (religious scholars) support it as positive, self-affirming, and
cognizant of human needs. Challenged by secularly educated urban Iranian women, and men and by the
West, the ulama have been called upon to address themselves to the implications of this custom for modern
Iranian society, to respond to the changes that mut'a is legally equivalent to hire or lease, that it is abusive of
women, and that it is in fact legalized prostitution. Law if Desire thus makes available previously untapped
and undocumented data about an institution in which sexuality, morality, religious rules, secular laws, and
cultural practices converge. This important work will be of interest to cultural anthropologist, religious
scholars, scholars of the Middle East, and lawyers as well as to those interested in the role of women in
Islamic society.
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From reader reviews:

Rebecca Shadwick:

The book Law of Desire: Temporary Marriage in Shi'i Iran, Revised Edition (Contemporary Issues in the
Middle East) make one feel enjoy for your spare time. You should use to make your capable considerably
more increase. Book can to be your best friend when you getting anxiety or having big problem with the
subject. If you can make examining a book Law of Desire: Temporary Marriage in Shi'i Iran, Revised
Edition (Contemporary Issues in the Middle East) for being your habit, you can get considerably more
advantages, like add your personal capable, increase your knowledge about several or all subjects. You are
able to know everything if you like open and read a book Law of Desire: Temporary Marriage in Shi'i Iran,
Revised Edition (Contemporary Issues in the Middle East). Kinds of book are several. It means that, science
book or encyclopedia or some others. So , how do you think about this guide?

Catherine Poppe:

Reading a reserve tends to be new life style on this era globalization. With studying you can get a lot of
information that can give you benefit in your life. Together with book everyone in this world can certainly
share their idea. Publications can also inspire a lot of people. Lots of author can inspire their reader with their
story or maybe their experience. Not only the story that share in the guides. But also they write about the
information about something that you need instance. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach
children, there are many kinds of book which exist now. The authors nowadays always try to improve their
proficiency in writing, they also doing some analysis before they write to the book. One of them is this Law
of Desire: Temporary Marriage in Shi'i Iran, Revised Edition (Contemporary Issues in the Middle East).

Irene Justice:

Reading can called thoughts hangout, why? Because if you are reading a book specially book entitled Law of
Desire: Temporary Marriage in Shi'i Iran, Revised Edition (Contemporary Issues in the Middle East) your
head will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in most aspect that maybe unidentified for but
surely can become your mind friends. Imaging each and every word written in a reserve then become one
web form conclusion and explanation that maybe you never get prior to. The Law of Desire: Temporary
Marriage in Shi'i Iran, Revised Edition (Contemporary Issues in the Middle East) giving you a different
experience more than blown away your head but also giving you useful details for your better life on this era.
So now let us show you the relaxing pattern is your body and mind will be pleased when you are finished
reading it, like winning a casino game. Do you want to try this extraordinary paying spare time activity?

Jason Ayers:

Do you like reading a guide? Confuse to looking for your favorite book? Or your book ended up being rare?
Why so many query for the book? But almost any people feel that they enjoy for reading. Some people likes
looking at, not only science book and also novel and Law of Desire: Temporary Marriage in Shi'i Iran,



Revised Edition (Contemporary Issues in the Middle East) or maybe others sources were given know-how
for you. After you know how the great a book, you feel desire to read more and more. Science book was
created for teacher or perhaps students especially. Those textbooks are helping them to put their knowledge.
In some other case, beside science book, any other book likes Law of Desire: Temporary Marriage in Shi'i
Iran, Revised Edition (Contemporary Issues in the Middle East) to make your spare time far more colorful.
Many types of book like this.
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