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Two years after his wife's death, oceanographer and former navy SEAL, Atticus Young, attempts to
reconcile with his rebellious daughter, Giona, by taking her on the scuba dive of a lifetime-swimming with a
pod of peaceful humpback whales in the Gulf of Maine. But the beauty of the sea belies a terror from the
deep-a horrific creature as immense as it is ancient. There is no blood, no scream, no fight. Giona is
swallowed whole by the massive jaws. Only Atticus remains to suffer the shame of the survivor and his
inconsolable grief turns to an unquenchable thirst for revenge.

Drawn by the spectacle, Trevor Manfred, a ruthless billionaire, approaches Atticus with a proposition:
Trevor will make available all the advanced technology of his heavily armed mega-yacht, the Titan, to aid
Atticus in his death-quest. In return, Trevor is to receive the beast's corpse as the ultimate hunting trophy.
But in the midst of the hunt, Atticus makes a terrifying discovery that changes the way he sees the ocean's
creatures and begs the question: what is Kronos? The answer sets him on a new and much more deadly
course.
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From reader reviews:

Jeremy Smith:

Have you spare time for any day? What do you do when you have much more or little spare time? Yeah, you
can choose the suitable activity to get spend your time. Any person spent their own spare time to take a walk,
shopping, or went to the Mall. How about open or even read a book allowed Kronos? Maybe it is to get best
activity for you. You understand beside you can spend your time using your favorite's book, you can better
than before. Do you agree with the opinion or you have various other opinion?

Linda Cunningham:

Book is actually written, printed, or descriptive for everything. You can learn everything you want by a
book. Book has a different type. As it is known to us that book is important factor to bring us around the
world. Close to that you can your reading talent was fluently. A publication Kronos will make you to end up
being smarter. You can feel considerably more confidence if you can know about almost everything. But
some of you think this open or reading the book make you bored. It is not make you fun. Why they may be
thought like that? Have you in search of best book or suitable book with you?

Mark Maney:

The book Kronos has a lot of information on it. So when you make sure to read this book you can get a lot of
advantage. The book was compiled by the very famous author. Tom makes some research ahead of write this
book. That book very easy to read you can obtain the point easily after perusing this book.

Phillip Barker:

Kronos can be one of your starter books that are good idea. Most of us recommend that straight away
because this guide has good vocabulary that will increase your knowledge in vocab, easy to understand, bit
entertaining but nevertheless delivering the information. The article writer giving his/her effort to place every
word into delight arrangement in writing Kronos however doesn't forget the main point, giving the reader the
hottest as well as based confirm resource information that maybe you can be one among it. This great
information may drawn you into brand new stage of crucial contemplating.
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