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How does one Creole beauty choose between the two men who’ve both captured her heart?
Meet Angelique Baptiste…Happy with her career, her friends, and her man…sans the sex life, thanks to her
shrink. After years of relying far too much on sex appeal to choose her partners, she accepts her therapist’s
opinion that it’s done nothing but hinder her ability to make wise choices. As a result, she’s spent the last six
months as chaste as a nun in a monastery, much to the chagrin of one particular ‘friend-with-potential’ to be
much more.

Michael Harper is a man of integrity, as well as a detective for the Lafayette Police Department. He doesn’t
hide the fact that he’s crazy about Angelique, and he’s willing to wait for her to serve out her sentence of
self-imposed celibacy. As trying as it is to be around her, he knows the reward for his perseverance will be a
lifetime with the woman he loves. Or will it?

Enter Liam Nash, ex-Navy Seal turned body guard, who has the unfortunate reputation of being the last man
to break Angelique’s heart. More than a year earlier they’d been a couple, but rather than commit to a
lifetime with her, he’d high tailed it back to Texas. Within minutes of swaggering back into her life, he
proves his reason for leaving was justified. He’s defeated the demons from his past and is all too willing to
work at a happily ever after with her.

Torn between the two men she loves equally, Angelique agonizes over the choice she knows she must make.
Just when she decides she can’t break one heart over another, fate steps in to decide for her.

This novel includes a chilling subplot of a young mother, Sarah Richard, and her efforts to free herself and
her twin infant daughters from the abuse of her estranged husband.

Note from the author:

The Halos and Horns series is filled with new characters you’ll love, along with recurrent appearances of old
favorites from my La Fleur de Love series. Enjoy!

~ Lori Leger ~
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From reader reviews:

Carol Welch:

Book is written, printed, or outlined for everything. You can understand everything you want by a
publication. Book has a different type. We all know that that book is important factor to bring us around the
world. Close to that you can your reading ability was fluently. A reserve Green Eyed Temptation: Halos &
Horns: Book One will make you to always be smarter. You can feel more confidence if you can know about
anything. But some of you think that open or reading any book make you bored. It is not make you fun. Why
they might be thought like that? Have you seeking best book or suitable book with you?

Charles Stephens:

Now a day people who Living in the era where everything reachable by talk with the internet and the
resources inside it can be true or not involve people to be aware of each info they get. How individuals to be
smart in acquiring any information nowadays? Of course the solution is reading a book. Reading through a
book can help folks out of this uncertainty Information mainly this Green Eyed Temptation: Halos & Horns:
Book One book as this book offers you rich information and knowledge. Of course the knowledge in this
book hundred percent guarantees there is no doubt in it you may already know.

William Wright:

Are you kind of hectic person, only have 10 or perhaps 15 minute in your morning to upgrading your mind
expertise or thinking skill also analytical thinking? Then you are experiencing problem with the book when
compared with can satisfy your small amount of time to read it because pretty much everything time you
only find publication that need more time to be go through. Green Eyed Temptation: Halos & Horns: Book
One can be your answer since it can be read by anyone who have those short free time problems.

Sheila Dickerson:

You are able to spend your free time to study this book this reserve. This Green Eyed Temptation: Halos &
Horns: Book One is simple to create you can read it in the park, in the beach, train as well as soon. If you did
not include much space to bring typically the printed book, you can buy the actual e-book. It is make you
quicker to read it. You can save the particular book in your smart phone. So there are a lot of benefits that
you will get when you buy this book.
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