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Updated & Expanded! This is the most complete, precise, authoritative and comprehensive work ever done
on Mauser bolt rifles . . . so inclusive that a thorough knowledge of it will make you a Mauser expert in your
own right! Within its covers are: Exhaustive data on each development, all specific characteristics,
variations, models, innovations, modifications. Countries who made or bought Mausers and their changes
and markings. Complete ammo data, ballistics, effectiveness and uses. How to identify details. "How-it-
works" drawings/pictures with step-by-step instructions. Foreign and contract rifles. Sporters including
Oberndorf and foreign models. Experimental rifles. And, pictures - hundreds of beautifully photographed
original rifles, many so rare they are not even in museums, but hidden in the finest private collections. Makes
positive identification of valuable collectibles sure and easy. Saves bucks and embarrassment at gun shows
and in the shop. There are so many thousands of Mauser rifles in the U.S. that you cannot trade, fix or collect
guns without encountering them - making the book an invaluable tool of the trade on your bench or in your
library. For, if Mauser made it, designed or developed it - and it was a bolt rifle - it's in the book! 372 large-
size 8½" x 11" pages. Over 672 photos, drawings, exploded views, cutaways. Hundreds of charts, spec
tables, data tables and symbols. Thoroughly cross-indexed not only by Model, but also by variations,
Countries, accessories used and people in Mauser's history. Extensive bibliography, listing all the books,
catalogs, articles and foreign sources. Detailed listing of all the people who helped. Everything about Mauser
bolt rifles is here - and to know and understand Mauser rifles is to understand all rifles . . . for this is the one
they all copied. And, it is all in one magnificent volume. An extremely handsome, lavishly illustrated book.
Deluxe hardbound cloth cover.
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From reader reviews:

Valerie Garrison:

What do you about book? It is not important to you? Or just adding material if you want something to
explain what the one you have problem? How about your extra time? Or are you busy individual? If you
don't have spare time to try and do others business, it is make one feel bored faster. And you have free time?
What did you do? All people has many questions above. They should answer that question mainly because
just their can do that will. It said that about guide. Book is familiar on every person. Yes, it is proper.
Because start from on kindergarten until university need this kind of Mauser Bolt Rifles to read.

Adam Cohn:

This Mauser Bolt Rifles tend to be reliable for you who want to be considered a successful person, why. The
key reason why of this Mauser Bolt Rifles can be one of several great books you must have will be giving
you more than just simple studying food but feed a person with information that probably will shock your
previous knowledge. This book is actually handy, you can bring it everywhere and whenever your conditions
in e-book and printed ones. Beside that this Mauser Bolt Rifles forcing you to have an enormous of
experience like rich vocabulary, giving you tryout of critical thinking that we realize it useful in your day
activity. So , let's have it and revel in reading.

Francis Knapp:

You can spend your free time to study this book this guide. This Mauser Bolt Rifles is simple to deliver you
can read it in the park, in the beach, train and soon. If you did not have much space to bring the particular
printed book, you can buy typically the e-book. It is make you easier to read it. You can save often the book
in your smart phone. So there are a lot of benefits that you will get when one buys this book.

Barbara Roundtree:

A lot of e-book has printed but it is different. You can get it by world wide web on social media. You can
choose the top book for you, science, amusing, novel, or whatever through searching from it. It is referred to
as of book Mauser Bolt Rifles. You can contribute your knowledge by it. Without departing the printed
book, it could add your knowledge and make you happier to read. It is most important that, you must aware
about book. It can bring you from one destination for a other place.
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