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It's 8:35 pm on New Year's Eve, and Private Detective John Justin Mallory is hiding out in his Manhattan
office to avoid his landlord's persistent inquiries about the unpaid rent. As he cheerlessly reflects on the
passing of a lousy year, which saw his business partner run off with his wife, he assumes the bourbon is
responsible for the appearance of a belligerent elf. This elf informs him that he needs the detective’s help in
searching for a unicorn that was stolen from his charge.

When Mallory realizes the little green fellow is not going to disappear with the passing of his inebriation, he
listens to the elf's impassioned plea that the stolen magical beast must be returned to his care by daylight or
his little green life will be forfeited by the elves’ guild.

Join detective Mallory on a New Year's night of wild adventure in a fantasy Manhattan of leprechauns,
gnomes, and Harpies as he matches wits with the all-powerful demon "The Grundy" in a race to find the
missing unicorn before time runs out!
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From reader reviews:

John Charles:

With other case, little individuals like to read book Stalking the Unicorn: A John Justin Mallory Mystery.
You can choose the best book if you love reading a book. As long as we know about how is important any
book Stalking the Unicorn: A John Justin Mallory Mystery. You can add information and of course you can
around the world with a book. Absolutely right, mainly because from book you can recognize everything!
From your country until eventually foreign or abroad you will end up known. About simple point until
wonderful thing you could know that. In this era, we can easily open a book as well as searching by internet
product. It is called e-book. You can use it when you feel bored stiff to go to the library. Let's study.

Charles Collier:

People live in this new time of lifestyle always try and and must have the time or they will get lots of stress
from both daily life and work. So , if we ask do people have time, we will say absolutely indeed. People is
human not just a robot. Then we consult again, what kind of activity have you got when the spare time
coming to anyone of course your answer will probably unlimited right. Then do you try this one, reading
publications. It can be your alternative within spending your spare time, the actual book you have read will
be Stalking the Unicorn: A John Justin Mallory Mystery.

Jose Lloyd:

The book untitled Stalking the Unicorn: A John Justin Mallory Mystery contain a lot of information on the
item. The writer explains your ex idea with easy approach. The language is very clear to see all the people,
so do not necessarily worry, you can easy to read the item. The book was compiled by famous author. The
author provides you in the new era of literary works. You can actually read this book because you can read
on your smart phone, or program, so you can read the book with anywhere and anytime. In a situation you
wish to purchase the e-book, you can start their official web-site as well as order it. Have a nice read.

Philip Brown:

Reserve is one of source of information. We can add our information from it. Not only for students but in
addition native or citizen will need book to know the change information of year to be able to year. As we
know those guides have many advantages. Beside all of us add our knowledge, could also bring us to around
the world. From the book Stalking the Unicorn: A John Justin Mallory Mystery we can consider more
advantage. Don't one to be creative people? To be creative person must choose to read a book. Just choose
the best book that suited with your aim. Don't always be doubt to change your life with that book Stalking
the Unicorn: A John Justin Mallory Mystery. You can more appealing than now.
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