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Book 1 of the Felony Romance Series. Dark, dirty and bursting with
bad boys.

An uptight accountant.
An irresistible bartender.
An attraction complicated by secrets, obligations, and broken promises.

A few minutes past midnight on a hot June night, Ally Taylor turns out the lights of her office, catches a cab
to the seamy side of town, and slides onto a barstool at Felony Bar, a notorious underground club. The
bartender, Jack Jameson, slides a gin and tonic across the counter before she says a word because he already
knows what she likes. When he leaves, her gaze follows him. His broad shoulders, tattoos and dreamy dark
eyes promise everything missing from her life. Spontaneity. Promiscuity. Adventure. He is the green grass
on the other side of her self-imposed fence, a tempting dish she covets but would never taste. As much as
she’s attracted to him, it’s hard to forget that she was engaged to someone else a week ago, especially when
that someone is making out with her ex-best friend at the end of the bar.

She needs to shake off the illicit thoughts Jack inspires, but when he nods toward a secret door, inviting her
into the darkness, she follows. He’s the devil, and she’s the unwilling sinner. She wants to taste him, feel
him, use him to forget all the pain of her broken engagement. He presses her against the wall, hands gliding
beneath her skirt. Never one for wild decisions, she’s torn between desire and common sense, love and lust.

Jack likes female companionship, someone to take away the ache of emptiness he feels most of the time.
One-night stands are a dime a dozen at Felony, but he’s not a kid anymore and he’s tired of waking up in
someone else’s bed. Ally’s calm and cool control fuels the animal inside him. He yearns to break that
control, to get a taste of the passion lurking inside her. In spite of his playboy ways, he wants more than sex,
more than temporary, more than meaningless. Can he find what he needs in Ally?

As their relationship unfolds, the choices become more and more difficult. They both have painful secrets.
Neither of them wants to commit, but they can’t stop the way they feel about each other. When love comes
calling, they may not have a choice.

Intoxicated is an adult erotic romance about misguided allegiance, painful truths, and relentless attraction.
Subject matter deals with drug addiction, blended families, and mental illness. It contains adult situations,
adult language, and hot sex. It is a standalone, complete novel with a “happy for now” ending.

Book 1: Intoxicated
Book 2: Unexpected
Book 3: Vindicated
Book 4: Impulsive



Book 5: Drift

For more from this author, check out the Pretty Broken Series (Pretty Broken Girl and Pretty Filthy Lies).
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From reader reviews:

Sheri Reagan:

Book is to be different for every single grade. Book for children until adult are different content. As it is
known to us that book is very important for people. The book Intoxicated (Felony Romance Book 1) ended
up being making you to know about other know-how and of course you can take more information. It is
rather advantages for you. The reserve Intoxicated (Felony Romance Book 1) is not only giving you far more
new information but also being your friend when you feel bored. You can spend your own personal spend
time to read your e-book. Try to make relationship together with the book Intoxicated (Felony Romance
Book 1). You never sense lose out for everything in case you read some books.

Robert Clift:

Do you certainly one of people who can't read pleasant if the sentence chained inside straightway, hold on
guys that aren't like that. This Intoxicated (Felony Romance Book 1) book is readable simply by you who
hate the perfect word style. You will find the information here are arrange for enjoyable reading through
experience without leaving actually decrease the knowledge that want to supply to you. The writer of
Intoxicated (Felony Romance Book 1) content conveys prospect easily to understand by most people. The
printed and e-book are not different in the articles but it just different by means of it. So , do you even now
thinking Intoxicated (Felony Romance Book 1) is not loveable to be your top list reading book?

Robert Reynolds:

Hey guys, do you wants to finds a new book to learn? May be the book with the subject Intoxicated (Felony
Romance Book 1) suitable to you? The book was written by renowned writer in this era. Typically the book
untitled Intoxicated (Felony Romance Book 1)is the one of several books this everyone read now. This
particular book was inspired a number of people in the world. When you read this e-book you will enter the
new shape that you ever know before. The author explained their concept in the simple way, therefore all of
people can easily to be aware of the core of this publication. This book will give you a large amount of
information about this world now. To help you see the represented of the world within this book.

Joshua McIntosh:

Do you like reading a e-book? Confuse to looking for your favorite book? Or your book had been rare? Why
so many problem for the book? But any kind of people feel that they enjoy to get reading. Some people likes
reading, not only science book but in addition novel and Intoxicated (Felony Romance Book 1) or perhaps
others sources were given knowledge for you. After you know how the fantastic a book, you feel want to
read more and more. Science reserve was created for teacher or maybe students especially. Those textbooks
are helping them to increase their knowledge. In some other case, beside science book, any other book likes
Intoxicated (Felony Romance Book 1) to make your spare time much more colorful. Many types of book like
here.
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