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The Vaqueiros de Alzada, a cattle-herding people in the Asturian mountains of Spain, have one of the
highest suicide rates in Europe—and an attitude toward death that gives this statistic unusual meaning. This
World, Other Worlds considers death among the Vaqueiros as a central cultural fact which reveals local ideas
about the origin and destiny of humans, the relations of humans and animals, the configuration of the
universe, and the nature of society. Interested chiefly in the conceptual and meaningful aspects of death,
María Cátedra focuses on the cultural resources with which the Vaqueiros confront their own
mortality—how they experience death and what this reveals about the way they see this world and other
worlds.

Applying sensitive ethnographic insight to a rich body of oral testimony, Cátedra discloses an unsuspected
symbolic universe native to the Vaqueiros. Death is seen here in close, coherent relation to pain, age, and
suffering; sickness and suicide, one must understand the cultural valuation of different ways of dying and the
conditions under which suicides take place. To understand what it means to be a Vaqueiro is to understand
how suicide can be perceived by a people as acceptable.

A groundbreaking work in European ethnography, This World, Other Worlds takes symbolic analysis to a
new level. In its illumination of local conceptions of death, grace, and sainthood, the book also makes a
substantial contribution to the anthropology of religion.
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From reader reviews:

Oren Nelson:

In this 21st one hundred year, people become competitive in each way. By being competitive now, people
have do something to make these people survives, being in the middle of the particular crowded place and
notice through surrounding. One thing that often many people have underestimated it for a while is reading.
Yep, by reading a e-book your ability to survive increase then having chance to endure than other is high.
For you who want to start reading any book, we give you this This World, Other Worlds: Sickness, Suicide,
Death, and the Afterlife among the Vaqueiros de Alzada of Spain book as starter and daily reading e-book.
Why, because this book is greater than just a book.

Effie Morris:

A lot of people always spent their free time to vacation or go to the outside with them loved ones or their
friend. Did you know? Many a lot of people spent these people free time just watching TV, as well as
playing video games all day long. If you need to try to find a new activity here is look different you can read
the book. It is really fun for you. If you enjoy the book that you read you can spent all day every day to
reading a guide. The book This World, Other Worlds: Sickness, Suicide, Death, and the Afterlife among the
Vaqueiros de Alzada of Spain it doesn't matter what good to read. There are a lot of individuals who
recommended this book. These folks were enjoying reading this book. When you did not have enough space
bringing this book you can buy often the e-book. You can m0ore effortlessly to read this book out of your
smart phone. The price is not too expensive but this book features high quality.

Marsha Gleason:

What is your hobby? Have you heard which question when you got learners? We believe that that problem
was given by teacher with their students. Many kinds of hobby, Every individual has different hobby. And
also you know that little person such as reading or as reading become their hobby. You should know that
reading is very important along with book as to be the factor. Book is important thing to include you
knowledge, except your own teacher or lecturer. You will find good news or update about something by
book. Many kinds of books that can you choose to use be your object. One of them is actually This World,
Other Worlds: Sickness, Suicide, Death, and the Afterlife among the Vaqueiros de Alzada of Spain.

John Cotton:

Some individuals said that they feel bored stiff when they reading a book. They are directly felt the item
when they get a half parts of the book. You can choose the actual book This World, Other Worlds: Sickness,
Suicide, Death, and the Afterlife among the Vaqueiros de Alzada of Spain to make your own personal
reading is interesting. Your skill of reading ability is developing when you just like reading. Try to choose
basic book to make you enjoy to study it and mingle the impression about book and looking at especially. It
is to be 1st opinion for you to like to available a book and go through it. Beside that the book This World,



Other Worlds: Sickness, Suicide, Death, and the Afterlife among the Vaqueiros de Alzada of Spain can to be
your brand new friend when you're sense alone and confuse with the information must you're doing of the
time.
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